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Biographical Notes 
 
Wong Ah Fook (12 March 1837 – 12 September 1918) – Businessman/philanthropist 
 
Wong Ah Fook was a well-known businessman in Singapore and Johor Bahru in the late 19th and 
early 20th century.  
 
Wong was born Wong Fook Kee on 12 March 1837 to Wong Mau Chiu, a poor peasant in Taishan, 
Guangdong.1 In 1854, at the age of 17, Wong came to Singapore to escape poverty and the 
upheavals caused by civil wars in China.2 He apprenticed himself to a carpenter, who a few years 
later, gave Wong a share of the business.3  
 
Wong later started his own business, Him Yuen & Co.4 By the 1860s, Wong had made the 
acquaintance of Temenggong Sri Maharaja Abu Bakar of Johor (later Sultan Abu Bakar) and went on 
to establish a business relationship with him. That relationship formed the foundation of Wong’s 
expansion into Johor Bahru, where he eventually made his fortune.5 
 
In the later part of the 19th century, Wong became one of the biggest government contractors in 
Johor,6 with several key buildings to his name. They included the Istana Besar (1864),7 Istana Zahara 
and Balai Zaharah (1889),8 and Senyum, the residence of Johor’s first Mentri Besar (1893),9 among 
others. Wong was also involved in the building and maintenance of public works,10 including the jail in 
Johor Bahru.11 Wong was also granted revenue farming (gambier and pepper) by the Johor 
government between 1886 and 1891.12  
 
In 1892, Sultan Abu Bakar granted Wong a substantial tract of land in what is today’s central Johor 
Bahru for “services rendered”. That area came to be known as Kampong Ah Fook. There, Wong built 
roads that connected to his properties. The main arterial road was Jalan Wong Ah Fook, and the 
three other roads in the vicinity were named after Wong’s older sons -  Jalan Siu Nam, Jalan Siu Kun 
and Jalan Siu Chin.13 Between 1892 and 1908, Wong was granted the revenue farming concession 
for gambling houses and opium shops in Kampong Ah Fook.14  
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Wong also left his mark on Singapore, where he built Sultan Abu Bakar’s palace and the Istana 
Tyersall (1892).15 He was also involved in the construction of the Victoria Memorial Hall (1905), being 
on the local committee raising funds for the project.16 
 
Besides construction and gambier farming, Wong was also involved in banking. He was a founder, 
managing director and principal promoter of the Kwong Yik Bank.17 Established in 1903 to serve the 
needs of the local Chinese businesses, the Bank was the first Chinese bank to be incorporated in 
Malaya. 18 The bank was liquidated in 1913 following mismanagement by some directors.19 
 
Beyond business, Wong was active in philanthropy and community service.  Wong donated to various 
charities and social organisations, such as Tan Tock Seng’s hospital.20 In 1904, the Sultan of Johor 
conferred the Seri Mahkota Johor on Wong for services rendered. 21 He was also made a Justice of 
Peace.22 
 
Wong was also community leader especially among the Cantonese. He was one of the founders of 
the Cantonese clan association, Persatuan Kwong Siew Wai Kuan,23 and was one of the first 
directors of the Foon Yew School established by the association in 1912.24 
 
He helped established the Kwong Wai Siu Hospital (1911)25 and was the first president of the Board 
of trustees.26 He also was one of the founders of the Cantonese cemetery grounds, the Kwong Wai 
Siu Pek San Theng (1906).27  
 
 
 
 

 
 
Wong had two wives, with whom he had nine children. Among them were prominent businessmen S 
Q Wong and S K Wong.28  
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Wong died on 12 September 1918 in Singapore, and he was buried at the Kwong Wai Siu Pek San 
Theng.29  
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